Item O07a

From: Elaine Campbell

Sent: 22 October 2020 16:28

To: Paula Haynes

Cc: Alastair McGhee; Gillian Ross
Subject: RE: ESF 15/16 Clawback

Paula

Thanks for your e mail and apologies for the delay in replying. | can confirm that the college accepts
the final figure of £14,763.39 as noted below.

Elaine

From: Paula Haynes

Sent: 16 October 2020 16:33

To: Gillian Ross

Cc: Alastair McGhee ; Elaine Campbell
RE: ESF 15/16 Clawback

Hi Gillian

Many thanks for all your work to present mitigation against the initial recovery position in relation to
15/16 delivery.

Having now reviewed all the additional evidence the revised position for recovery is £14,763.39. |
have uploaded the spreadsheet to the server for your reference. This now shows without any filter
S0 you can see the position on all students.

In relation to the 5 students who were removed during the initial reconciliation process, and
therefore not initially reviewed, only 2 of these were deemed to have fully acceptable/suitable
evidence. Unfortunately, the other 3 have various contradicting NEET status issues/lack of evidence
to support, therefore | couldn’t make use of these to offset the recovery further. Notes on findings
are included in the spreadsheet.

While this is not the official final position, it is the position I'd like to now present back to my
director for consideration, noting that between the college and ESF teams we have now reached a
stage that we have exhausted our iterations and content with the revised position. It will only be

after this consideration that any communication to Principals will be made.

Grateful if you could review the spreadsheet and note your agreement (or otherwise) by Wed 21°
October.

Have a great weekend.
Kind regards,

Paula Haynes



From: Gillian Ross

Sent: 15 October 2020 15:29

To: Paula Haynes

Cc: Alastair McGhee; Elaine Campbell
Subject: RE: ESF 15/16 Clawback

Hi Paula

| have pulled together the evidence as noted below and this has now been uploaded to the

server. File name ‘GKC 15-16 Response 3 Missed Evidence.zip’.

Please let me know if anything appears to be missing. The bank statements you will have from the
previous upload.

Many thanks

Gillian Ross

Compliance & Monitoring Officer
Funding Department

Business Development

Glasgow Kelvin College

From: Paula Haynes

Sent: 12 October 2020 16:14

To: Gillian Ross

Cc: Alastair McGhee , Elaine Campbell
Subject: RE: ESF 15/16 Clawback

Hi Gillian
Typical all things did not go to plan last week and I’'m just getting a look at your returns today.

Good news is that nothing seems to have gone a miss during the zipping but | do have some missing
bursary awards and also need the raw data on the instalments for the following students:

e JMains

e SKimbala
e S Burnett
eV Ruthven

Grateful if you could upload these to the server as soon as practically possible and I'll aim to get this
finalised this week.

Kind regards,
Paula Haynes

From: Gillian Ross

Sent: 07 October 2020 13:21

To: Paula Haynes

Cc: esf; Alastair McGhee; Elaine Campbell
Subject: RE: ESF 15/16 Clawback

Hi Paula
Thank you for the extension. | have now uploaded our response and all additional evidence to the
secure server.



I've attached a full note of all the files that have been uploaded. Please alert us if you see that any
of them have not copied over during the zipping.

We look forward to hearing from you in due course.

Many thanks

Gillian Ross

Compliance & Monitoring Officer
Funding Department

Business Development

Glasgow Kelvin College

From: Paula Haynes

Sent: 02 October 2020 10:04

To: Elaine Campbell

Cc: Gillian Ross ; esf ; Alastair McGhee >
Subject: RE: ESF 15/16 Clawback

Hi Elaine

No problem, happy to extend to Wednesday.
Kind regards,

Paula Haynes

From: Elaine Campbell

Sent: 02 October 2020 10:03

To: Paula Haynes

Cc: Gillian Ross; esf; Alastair McGhee
Subject: RE: ESF 15/16 Clawback

Hi Paula

Thanks for your e mail. We are currently working through the list and have found more information
for the mitigation, however could we ask for additional time to return please? Could we possibly
return the completed spreadsheet to you by Wednesday next week as this will give us time to gather
the remaining information.

Many thanks.

From: Paula Haynes

Sent: 25 September 2020 15:14

To: Alastair McGhee

Cc: Elaine Campbell ; Gillian Ross ; esf
Subject: RE: ESF 15/16 Clawback

Afternoon All



I've now had the opportunity to review all responses along with associated evidence currently held
by SFC in relation to the recovery and mitigation of 15/16 activity and costs.

A summary of the revised position is now noted below and I've also added some further responses
alongside the points made in your initial email.

e Mitigation totalling £22,893.54 has been agreed in relation to 205 students.

o Generally most of these initial issues related to the minor increases to bursary
payments from April/May that were not fully evidenced from the initial award
letters. While there is no issue regarding increases to any bursary awarded, as with
all things ESF, all costs claimed need to have supporting evidence down to the last
penny.

o Other issues where mitigation has been agreed relate to individual payments made
and evidenced by the college but missed during SFC’s checks. Improvements on
checks undertaken by SFC have been ongoing since these early days, including
checks to ensure this type of oversight is minimised in the future.

e Recovery has been deemed to remain due for 9 students, totalling £16,201.70.
o Further explanations are provide on an individual basis in the revised spreadsheet.
e Further mitigation remains possible for a further 10 students totalling £51,343.31.
o Further explanations have been provided for each of these students within the
revised spreadsheet. These detail what the college can do to further aid mitigation.
e Aside from the main list of students, there were 5 students identified by yourselves (lines
300-304) where the student was flagged as ESF as per the final FES, but never made it to the
final student list due to SFC’s processes at that time. While these do not form part of the
current £90k recovery value, | have made comment on the spreadsheet for completeness.

The revised spreadsheet has now been uploaded to the server for your further
consideration, particularly in relation to those where further mitigation may be possible.
Grateful if you could provide any requested evidence by Friday 2" October.

By using the colour coding to sort column ‘AM’ you will be able to easily identify those
currently under query.

o Green — mitiation agreed
o Orange — mitigation still possible
o Red-—recovery remains due.

I’'m hopeful we are now not far away from reaching a final/acceptable position, however, if
anything at all is unclear please do not hesitate to call me direct and we can look resolve
any/all issues as soon as possible.

Kind regards,
Paula

Paula Haynes

From: Paula Haynes

Sent: 18 September 2020 12:04

To: Alastair McGhee

Cc: 'Elaine Campbell; Gillian Ross; esf
Subject: RE: ESF 15/16 Clawback



Dear Alastair

Thank you for your email (forwarded to myself from Rebecca) regarding further mitigation of the
proposed recovery in relation to 15/16 ESF activity and costs .

Pending the upload of the document with the individual comments, it will be myself undertaking this
further review (which | intend to commence today). In relation to the summary comments in your
email these will also be further considered. It is my intension to have any revised position returned
to you next week for further/final consideration.

Kind regards,
Paula

Paula Haynes

Senior Funding / Analysis Officer
Finance | lonmhas

Scottish Funding Council

From: Alastair McGhee

Sent: 18 September 2020 11:24
To: Rebecca Fairgrieve-Stewart
Cc: Elaine Campbell; Gillian Ross
Subject: ESF 15/16 Clawback

Dear Rebecca
ESF 15/16 Clawback

| refer to the ongoing discussions between Glasgow Kelvin College and the Scottish Funding Council
(SFC) with regards to the 2015/16 clawback. The College is extremely keen to bring this to a
conclusion as soon as possible.

The College acknowledges that the SFC has reduced the proposed clawback amount to around
£90,000 . However, the College continues to ascertain that this proposed clawback, even in its
reduced form, is excessive and | refer to the email from the SFC on the 13™ December 2017 which
states that “we have just received final feedback from the MA regarding the costs claim. | can
confirm the MA were content with the evidence provided and all costs were deemed eligible.” This
comment, while the wording could have been better, it actually related only to the evidence
supplied in relation to those students selected for sample by the MA.

Our view continues to be that we have met all monitoring and compliance requirements associated
with 2015/16 and that this level of clawback is unjustified.

Our position, in summary, is as follows;
Bursary Payments

The college concedes that one costs of circa £600 is ineligible and this is noted in the spreadsheet
which will be uploaded today. With regard to remaining points noted relating to bursary payments,



we maintain our response that no guidance was issued at the time regarding the ESF Bursary Rules
differing to the SFC Bursary Rules. The College complied with the Bursary Rules provided by SFC,
therefore we continue to dispute this recovery. Should additional guidance have been provided at
the time we would have sought to rectify this, but it is impossible to rectify retrospectively. Please
refer to bullet point one in my email above and comments within the spreadsheet — | would say in all
of these instances we have now agreed mitigation.

Flagged and Unflagged Students

At the time, we were confident that we would exceed our target for 15-16 and so to reduce the list
to make it compliant for audit purposes, as instructed by the SFC, should incur no penalty for the
College. Kelvin did exceed their target in 15/16. SFC reconciliation processes, at that time, restricted
the list of students to match the maximum credits both delivered and assumed claimable. Any
students subsequently found to be ineligible for one reason or another would have been excluded
from the claim. | think the terminology of ‘unflagging’ students at this time is perhaps confusing as
they were not ‘unflagged’ in FES terms, rather they just became ineligible for inclusion in our claim.
Therefore, depending upon the reason that made them ineligible, this would determine whether
recovery was due from the college, or covered by SFC. Please also refer to the final bullet point —
this allows further consideration of those students removed at the initial reconciliation stage.

Missing Evidence

With regard to clawback due to missing evidence, we maintain that we submitted all evidence that
was requested at the time. We request the SFC double checks these points. We can provide the full
files again if necessary. All files held by SFC have been further reviewed and where evidence remains
missing this has been noted in the comments and a request for re-upload of the files available from
the college.

The document that will be uploaded today provides a comment against each cost. | would
appreciate your guidance on how best we can resolve this at the earliest opportunity.

Yours sincerely
Alastair McGhee

Director of Business Development
Glasgow Kelvin College





